
From: Larry Visoski <-
Sent: Wednesday, January 25, 2017 3:55 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: G550 

I'll make the offers, 
Ogara 6550 appears NO Corporate Care on engines Has Honey Well HAPP MSP 

Sent f=om my iPhone 

On Jan 25, 2017, at 10:27 AM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

tell the o gara l=sting we will pay 17 for a quick close. 

> wrote: 

The OGara 550 left voice mail,. Ask of $20.995 posted,. 

The GV is in Naples Fl for the winte=„ Steve Wynn took original delivery„ current owner Purchased in 
2000, therplane travels between Naples and Rochester New York„ 

it only flies 100 hours a year low utili=ation original interior 
Dual FMS, no upgrades avionics„ 
More photos and spec sheets coming 
Message from Josh just now, 
"Can you still fly out this week? That will be very important to Chevr=n. Waiting two weeks for you to 

see the plane I be a problem" 

Sent from my iPhone 

please note 

The infor=ation contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-c=ient privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only=for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof i= strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
c=mmunication in error, please notify us immediately by 

EFTA_R1_01428663 
EFTA02396427



return e-mail or b= e-mail to jeeva=ation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies there=f, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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