From:

Sent: Tuesday, June 7, 2016 3:54 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re:

thank you... should i just step by or maybe i can haue-ar somebody Quick Pay to me? thank you soon much

2016-06-07 11:43 GMT-04:00 jeffr=y E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> >:

of course

On Tue,=Jun 7, 2016 at 11:32 AM, Kira D _ > wrote:<=r>

jeffrey, is anyway i can=ask you for 400 backs, i don't have anybody great for you, but just ge=into
situation that waiting for checks ect. anyway you can help me out? i=promise i will look

2016-06-07 11:23 GMT-04:00 jeffrey E. &l=;jeevacation@gm=il.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> >:

on Tue, Jun 7, 2016 at 11:18 A [ R RN

jeffrey, how ar= you darling? u in NY?

©=A0 please note

The information contained in this communicati=n is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute=inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. =t is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of =his
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may=be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please n=tify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:=eevacation@gmail.com>, and
=estroy this communication and all copies thereof,
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including all attachms=nts. copyright -all rights reserved
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