From: Madia

Sent: Friday, March 24, 2017 4:32 PM
To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Re: Fwd: double

Thank yo=!

From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

To: Richard Kahn <richardkahnl2=gmail.com>; nadia <nadja2102 @yahoo.com=>
Sent: Friday, March 24, 2017 6:32 AM

Subject: Fwd: double

p=eae send 45k today

---------- Forwarded message ----------
=rom: Nadia <
Date: Fri, Mar 24, 2017 at 2:53 AM
Su=ject: double

To: leffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com=>

<=r clear="none">

So | am at 530,400 since August, plus 10k in October, as discus=ed with Darren, and 52600 paid for mri. | also just
received a medical lab=bill for 51690. Total is 44,690...
| know it's la=t minute but is it possible to take care of this week?

&nbs=; please note

T=e information contained in this communication is
confide=tial, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute =nside information, and is intended only for
the use of t=e addressee. It is the property of

JEE

communic=tion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may =e unlawful. If you have received this
communication in e=ror, please notify us immediately by
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return e-mail or by=e-mail to jeevaca=ion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com=, and
destroy this communication and al= copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -a=| rights reserved
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