From: Lisa New (NN

Sent: Friday, September 26, 2014 1:06 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re:

that is incredibly kind of you to say. And | needed itl.=C2 | just was trying to fill in my Templeton query, | wrote the
executize summary, and lost it because | went to do something for 20 minutes=and now my careful paragraph is gone,
ewven though they say they autosave. =which I'm sure they do) I'm not sure I'll make it this =ycle for Templeton, though
I'd hoped to. | am good at deep reading, ye=, but can't do basic clerical work and don't have any help f=r the littlest
stuff.

| do have the fi=ance director of EdLabs, where | am now affiliated, working with me to get=very real numbers for you
on the HGSE piece of this project.--that is the =tuff for teachers before we get to WGBH episodes. They will administ=r
any funds for Harvard not given directly to the Ed School, and they are =ery good at this.

fnd I've aske= WGEBH to give an accounting of how we spent the 100,000 that funded the pi=ot...

Thank you Jeffrey. As I've sa=d, Poetry 1.1 anytime.

On Fri, Sep 26, 2014 at 7:53 AM, jeffrey E. <j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

Without a doubt the best hour, out of a week of hours , =as Lisa's deep reading , lesson 1.0
=br>--
plea=e note

The information contained in this communication is
confi=ential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside inform=tion, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the prop=rty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
commun=cation or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. =f you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immed=ately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gm=il.com>, and
destroy this c=mmunication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyrigh= -all rights reserved
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