From: Ann Rodriquez |

Sent: Wednesday, October 29, 2014 1:12 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re: pool filter

I'm sorry... this is th= first I'm hearing about this filter machine. I'll have it done today.

Ann R.

On Oct 29, 2014, at 9:08 AM, jeffrey E. &=t;jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wr=te:

1 month ago??7777
On Wednesday, October 29, 2014, Ann Rodriquez <annrodriquez @yahoo.com> wrote:

Danny said no.
=g said that he need to check on the size and the price. He's going to check=today.

Ann R.

On Oct 29, 2014, at 5:54 AM, jeffrey E. &=t; <javascript:_e{%7B%7D,'cvml’, jeevacation@gmail.com');>
did danny order the new pool filter machines.&n=sp; that he wanted?

=  please note

The information co=tained in this communication is

confidential, may be attorney-client pri=ileged, may

constitute inside information, and is intended only for
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communication or any part thereof is strictl= prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this
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,and

destroy this communication and al= copies thereof,

including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserv=d

EFTA_R1_01436651
EFTA02400781



=nbsp; please note

The information con=ained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client priv=leged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
th= use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, di=closure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly=prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communicati=n in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail t= jeevacation@gma=l.com <mailto;jeevacation@gmail.com=>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

EFTA_R1_01436652
EFTA02400782



