
To: Jeffrey Epsteinueevacation@gmail.comj 
From: Emad Hanna 
Sent Wed 9/29/2010 4:34:13 PM 
Subject FW: Bucket Crusher 

Jeffrey, 

I'm resubmitting the below request to process payment 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

From: Emad Hanna 
Sent: Friday, September 24, 2010 5:20 PM 
To: 'Jeffrey Epstein' 
Subject: Bucket Crusher 

Jeffrey, 

The bucket crusher that was purchased from Italy is in route so Gary is requesting to pay the 
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balance of 48,026.85 which is in Canadian dollars 

We have paid a deposit of S 15,177.10 USD. 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 
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