
To: Jeffre E teinijeevacationggmail.com] 
From: 
Sent un 10 3:58:43 PM 
Subject Re: 

His assistant has no info on the house. He spoke with Pinto and he said he would take care of 
getting the info when he returns to Paris this week. 
I will touch base with him tomorrow and remind him to get us the info when Pinto returns. 

On Aug 7, 2010, at 10:51 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

did we hear back from Pinto??? 

On Sat, Aug 7, 2010 at 9:47 PM wrote: 

I'm sorry.. I didn't check to see if there was cash in your black bag. Would you 
like me to have FTC have cash for you in the office on Monday? 

On Aug 7, 2010, at 7:50 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationagmail.com> wrote: 

did you leave me with any money? 

********************************* ***** ********************* 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jcevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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