
To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation©gmail.com] 
From: Emad Hanna 
Sent: Tue 8/3/2010 1:34:53 PM 
Subject: RE: Zorro Approval 

Same here Jeffrey I had no idea about either item until it was presented to me. So the work has been 
already done 

How do you want to handle this? 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, August 03, 2010 6:09 AM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Re: Zorro Approval 

news to me, 

On Mon, Aug 2, 2010 at 10:19 AM, Emad Hanna •c ,. wrote: 

Jeffrey, 

I received a payment request in the amount of S 7,543 for 3B's the work breakdown is: 

I ) S 3,691 for repairs and maintenance on the outside chess set fountain 

2) S 3,852 for Spanish style fountain for repairs to some of the damaged pieces and modification 
for many pieces to make it tightly fit. 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 
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PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

Ph 

Fax 

********************* ************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by c-mail to jesvacation©gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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