To: jeevacation@gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail com)
From: Jennie Saunders

Sent: Thur 12/2/2010 8:53:22 PM

Subject: FW: Fully Executed Lease

Saunders.Lease. Amendment. pdf

Wouldn't u say this is ambiguous at best ....As u know we moved out of 20 A and of course
want last rent payment be Jan 15 th and he is claiming it should be feb 15 .....please tale a
quick look and render Jeffrey god like advice @

CORE: Jennie Saunders | Founder & Chairman | 66 East 55th Street New York NY 10022 |
Main: 212 486 6600 | Mobile: 917 330 1033 | jennie.saunders@coreaccess.net |
WWW.Ccoreaccess.net

From: Jennie Saunders

Sent: Thursday, December 02, 2010 9:39 AM
To: 'Douglas A. Lobel, P.C.

Cc: Jennie Saunders

Subject: FW: Fully Executed Lease

Hi Douglas --Where can I call u today ...

CORE: Jennie Saunders | Founder & Chairman

WWW.COr N

From: Douglas A. Lobel, P.C. [mailto:douglasalobelpc@verizon.net]
Sent: Wednesday, February 24, 2010 3:40 PM

To: Jennie Saunders

Cc: 'Corinne Vitale'

Subject: Fully Executed Lease

EFTA_R1_01470515
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Jennie,

Enclosed is a fully executed copy of the Lease for your files,

Regards,

Doug
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