
To: Jeffrey Epstein 'emracation gmail.comj 
From: kaktus_roza 
Sent Mon 7/5/2010 4:20:57 PM 
Subject Re: 

Jeffrey! Can I ask u a favor 
As I told u last time its very hard time now for me in money side 
Can I ask u to pay this mount for my phone 104$ 
I have 20$ left and I need to pay till tmrw! 
u can ask anyone just go to T-mobile and say my number which Mend pay 104$ 
I really need your help 
Let me know if u can help! 
Thank u! 

Sent via BlackBerry from T-Mobile 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
Date: Mon, 5 Jul 2010 06.41.41 -0400 
To: rosa<kaktus_roza 
Subject: 

well? 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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