
To: J J[jeevacation@gmail.com] 
From: gmax 
Sent: Mon 6/28/2010 1:37:40 PM 
Subject: Re: G5 

Title: Rc: GS W/new avionics 22 

On 6/22/10 13:42 PM, "J J" <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

 Forwarded message 

From: <LVJET@aol.com>

Date: Tue, Jun 22, 2010 at 12:58 PM 

Subject: G5 

To: jeevacation@gmail.com 

Cc: 

Jeffrey, 
Darren Rothel told me that Bobby Kotic has a G5 in prebuy now, serial # 530 or 532 is what 

Darren told me. Darren said he really searched the market looking at all G5's. maybe 
he would share how much he paid for the G5, I think they where asking around 23M. 

Sean, can you find out the price after it closes? 
thanks 
Larry 
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