To: jeevacation@gmail com[jesvacation@gmail.com]
From:

Sent: Sun 2/28/2010 7:18:53 PM

Subject: Fwd: Lipokit at AACS booth# 122 - another info on Lipokit
okit&Maxstem-aninnovativeapproachtodermarejuv-2010Jan-Dr. pdf
Dr.Berman-Spaceliftwlipokit-2010. pdf

ook at attachments

Steven Vieter MD

Victor Dermatology & Rejuvenation PC

MNew York, MNew York 10021

To:
Sent; 2/27/2010 11:06:14 A M. Eastern Standard Time
Subj: Fwd: Lipokit at AACS booth# 122 - another info on Lipokit

Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:

From: peter jung
Date: February 5, 2010 2:53:32 PM EST

To: m
Subject: Re: Lipokit at AACS booth# 122 - another info on Lipokit

Hello Dr. Basil Pakeman,

I'm attaching more information on Lipokit.
Please let me know your interest in Lipokit.

Thanks
Peter Jung, COO

Medi-Khan Inc.
website: www.medi-khan.com  www_lipo-Kit. com
est hollywood, ca 90069

EFTA_R1_01472995
EFTA02411604



Dear Dr. Basil Pakeman,
Thanks for your visiting us with interest in Lipokit & MaxStem today.

As requested, I'm attaching some more information on Lipokit and MaxStem. The princing for
Lipokit is 30K USD plus tax and 16K USD plus tax.

The only consumable, syringe ( we call it as a FPU (fat processing unit) syringe) is offered at 25-
35 USD per each by prichasing quantity.

For more information, please let me know.

Best
Peter Jung, COO

Medi-Khan Inc
website: www medi-khan.com  www_lipo-Kit. com
est hollywood, ca 90069

EFTA_R1_01472996
EFTA02411605



