
To: 
Cc: 
From: Sean J. Lancaster 
Sent: Tue 6/22/2010 10:09:32 PM 
Subject: RE: G5 

'eevacation@gmailconteevacation©gmail.comj 

Looks like sn 530 at the price of $21.2. We need to remember that only serial number above 542 can be 
EASA/EURO certified which is becoming an issue for residual values. 

Best regards 

Sean J. Lancaster 

Bristol Associates Inc. 

www. bristolassociates.com 

This message may contain confidential andtr legally privileged ;Mannar:on If you em not the intended recipient of 
the message. please destroy it. Any unauthorized d,ssemination. titstnbutton or copying of the materiel in this 
message, and any attachments to the message, is stnctty forbidden. (c) 2008 all fronts resented 

From: 
Sent: Tuesday, June 22, 2010 12:59 PM 
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To: eevacabon n i 
Cc: 
Subject: G5 

Jeffrey, 

Darren Rothel told me that Bobby Kotic has a G5 in prebuy now, serial # 530 or 532 is what Darren told 
me. Darren said he really searched the market looking at all G5's. maybe he would share how much 
he paid for the G5, I think they where asking around 23M. 

Sean, can you find out the price after it closes? 

thanks 

Larry 

EFTA_R1_01473428 
EFTA02411904


