
To: Jeevacation[jeevacation@gmail.com] 
From: Rich Kahn 
Sent: Tue 6/15/2010 7:09:26 PM 
Subject: FW: Antilles School - Tuition Invoice 
20100324093958433.tif 

Please advise 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cell 

From: Cecile de Jongh [mailto 
Sent: Tuesday, June 15, 2010
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Fw: Antilles School - Tuition Invoice 

Hi Rich, 

This is the tuition bill for Antilles for 2010-2011. The amount stated is $15,900 but I 
paid a $1,000 deposit so the balance due is $14,900.00 

Thanks, 

Cecile 
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