
To: JEE[jeevacation@gmail.com] 
From: curtis R 
Sent: Fri 4/17/2009 9:38:40 PM 
Subject: Re: Mechanical budget revised 

Title: Re: Mechanical budget revised Around 50% paid 
A few numbers to be added on spread sheet. 
Bottom line to go down more in the end as far as I can see. 
I will give you full update on Monday as far as balance 

On 4/17/09 4:33 PM, "YEE" <jeevacation@grnailcom> wrote: 

what has been paid to date? 

On Fri, Apr 17, 2009 at 3:42 PM, curtis R .it IMM> wrote: 

We are currently working on scope and budget for the steel alternate 
building as per your request. We have the Engineer coming on Tuesday to 
review the condition of the hill. 

We will have a new budget for the generator and RO build out next week which should 
satisfy future demand and leave room for integration of steel or other 
options. 

Jeffrey, 
Please approve the revised previously approved budget on the 

Mechanical building. 
This is the existing budget reworked to more accurately represent the 

work done and completion of scope -Same as we did for 
the Office Pavilion. 

Original approved budget: $2,330,543.72 
Revised budget: $2,012,685.05 

I will report to you for approvals on Trade line items — ONLY if 
they 

go over Budget. 

Emad will monitor Budget as firewall against budget breach. 

I DO NOT anticipate any changes except downward in price. 
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