To: Jeevacation[jeevacation@agmail.com]
From: Emad Hanna

Sent: Sat 6/12/2010 2:11:09 AM

Subject: RE: Lady K repairs

leffrey,

The only thing we negotiated was getting them to waive 10 days of lay away totaling 5 2,500,

All of this work is parts and labor which | checked with Casey since he has been overseeing this whole
process

From: Jeevacation [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, June 11, 2010 7:26 PM

To: Emad Hanna

Subject: Re: Lady K repairs

Ok did you negotiate it

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 11, 2010, at 6:04 PM, "Emad Hanna" ':_ wrote:

Jeftrey,

We will need to send out a wire in the amount of $ 31,212 Monday morning in
order to get the boat picked up on Monday.

Please not there is still an outstanding invoice for the actual installation of the
engines which is about $ 8k and some additional smaller items that have yet to be
invoiced

Thank you
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Project Controller
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