To: Je vacation[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From:

Sent: Sat 12/4/2010 4:20:23 PM
Subject: Re:

Jeffrey, I'm working Nick now,. Give me a couple hours,. He's reviewing his pricing.

Just confirming you have selected the 2D projector?
Thx
Larry

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com=>
Date: Sat, 4 Dec 2010 10:44:50 -0500

To:

Subject: Re:

either that or no labor cost

On Sat, Dec 4. 2010 at 10-43 AM. _ wrote:

Jeftrey,
What do you think is fare?
Should I ask for a flat 10% on equipment, is that appropriate or more?

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jecvacation(i gmail.com>
Date: Sat, 4 Dec 2010 07:52:42 -0500

To
Ce:

Subject:

lets finalize nick today.. he should coordinate with Scott the IT person
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The mformation contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute mside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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