To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail. com)
From: Isabel Maxwell

Sent: Maon 10/25/2010 5:57:03 PM

Subject: Fwd: final check with you -

f yi Jeff - 1 just sent this - I'm *finally* boarding last leg to Marrakech.....

[ got one email that said they (Publicis/WEF) had not accessed their accounts as of about 3pm
today so i have no more information - but I wanted to prompt them one more time to go look
themselves! HOpe you don't mind me asking if you know anyway that your people did email
them a reference for the wires??

X0
Is

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Isabel Maxwell =

Date: Mon, Oct 25, 2010 at 7:49 PM

Subject: re: final check with you -

To: . idd)c East . icolc Amell
.

Dear WE Forum and Publicis Live -

I have not heard back from you but I am sending a final check from my end before 1 finally board
the Marrakech-bound flight from Madrid tonight here at the Madrid airport-

it is 7.45pm Spanish time.

[ utterly trust that you have been able to confirm the funds in by the end of this day your time,
into the two different bank accounts that you requested - those references from my end were
being sent independently of me by the wiring party in the United States, as [ have been traveling
the past 24 hours and am still en route - so I can have no visibility myself into the confirmations.
Kind Regards, I look forward to meeting you all and to speaking on the panel and participating in
the Forum of course.

[sabel

Isabel Maxwell

On Sat, Oct 23, 2010 at 12:54 PM, _ wrote:

Dear Ms Maxwell,

We thank you for your email and confirm you that your booking is well in
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order. We understand that we will receive the proof of wiring on Monday to
be able to finalize your reservation and update the hotel about the payment.
But your room 15 well reserved from Oct 25th to 29th and ready for your
arrival.

We have well confirmed with the hotel that your room will be non smoking.

We wish you a safe travel and look forward to welcoming you in Marrakech.

Kind regards
Marion

Hello!
I do confirm that the money wire for the hotel WAS SENT vyesterday,

and so also was the money wire to the WEF separately - their fee.

Unfortunately, | understand that I will need to wait for Monday am EST to have the "proof
of wiring emailed to you" that you have requested -

It will be emailed from a third party who has wired the funds.

[ will be en route to Marrakech by then but trust that all will be
fine and that by the time I arrive in Marrakech, you will indeed
have already received the proof you need and that my room
will be waiting!!

btw very very important that it be NON-SMOKING PLEASE!

Can you confirm that for me please! Of course 1 totally understand
that you will only be doing so upon receipt of my proof of payment !!!
=)

Thanks so much.

Best,

[sabel
Best regards

[sabel
On Fri, Oct 22, 2010 at 12:07 PM, _ wrote:
Dear Mrs Maxwell,

We didn't receive the money yet, please kindly forward us a proof of
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payment from your bank and we'll be able to confirm your room.
Shuttle buses will be running from the Marrakech airport to official
hotels

every 30min from 7am to 2am.

With best regards

Jamila
PublicisLive

Dear Rim! Dear Horst/PublicisLive

Almost there! -
1) Check for receipt of my fees please, see below -
2) Re my Arrival -

*1) Fee Arrival:* Please do your best to check with WEF and PublicisLive
Banking info

for the wires for both WEF Fee of $3,500 and a separate wire for $1088.94,
to PublicisLive have arrived safely. Both wires will have the name
"MAXWELL"

in the special instructions area

PLEASE LET ME KNOW BY EMAIL - THANK YOU !

I'll also be checking in with you again as well - email is best for me

now

also.

I depart on Sunday morning, 24th October for the long trek to Marrakech -

*2) Plane Arrival in Marrakech:*

Please can I be picked up from the airport - Please can you confirm -
Thank

you !

I arrive on Monday October 25th at 8.25pm Local Time in Marrakech

AIR ROYAL AIR MAROC  FLT:689 ECONOMY MADRID-MARRAKECH
OPERATED BY
ATLAS BLUE

LV MADRID 825P DEPART: TERMINAL 02HR 00MIN
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AR MARRAKECH  825P NON-STOP

ARRIVE: TERMINAL 1 REF: Z2NZU7

Kind Regards,

[sabel

On Thu, Oct 21, 2010 at 1:41 AM, _ wrote;

Dear Ms Maxwell,
Both options could be followed, either the wiring or credit card on site.
However, in case you prefer the wiring option, please send us a copy of
it.
Indeed , 1t may not been received at time . So, we prefer to have a copy
to
avoid you any inconvenience at the registration desk
[ stay at your disposal for further information

Best regards,

*#*¥Please note that I will be in Marrakech from 22-28 October. You may
reach me at my local mobile number m_**

Rim Lemsyeh

Senior Associate, MENA
World Economic Forum

91-93 route de la Capite
1223 Cologny/Geneva

Re: Payment Reminder of Participation Fee - World Economic Forum on the
Middle East and North Africa 2010
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[sabel Maxwell
to:
Middle East
20/10/2010 20:19

Please respond to imaxwell

Reference Code (keep this code in your email for tracking) : PLMAR10-00093

[sabel Maxwell
Director
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Venture Network

http:fwew. israelventurenetwork.org
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