
FTo: 

Sent Fri 11/12/2010 3:07:00 AM 
Subject Re: Hi 

Thanks. But I will speak with you before. 

Sent via BlackBerry from T-Mobile 

From: Jeffrey Epstein leevacation®gmail.com> 
Date: Fri, 12 Nov 2010 03:52:05 +0100 
To: 
Subject: Re: Hi 

I'll do wahatever you need 

On Fri, Nov 12, 2010 at 12:15 AM,  wrote: 

I bought apartment on a different company not with agency money. 

Sent via BlackBerry from T-Mobile 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationgeinail.coin> 
Date: Thu, 11 Nov 2010 23:09:56 +0100 
To: 
Subject: Re: Hi 

lets talk about it.. you should buy the apt in your own name, not the agency 

On Thu, Nov 11, 2010 at 10:16 PM, wrote: 

We are at 780 on the line of credit. I have bought the apartment and paid cash. We have a tax 
payment for NY year 2009 that has to be done. Can I use some of the line. I don't want the 
administration to start opening our case We will be at 750 at renewal time anyways. Let me 
know. Thank you jean Luc 

Sent via BlackBerry from T-Mobile 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
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Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationQgmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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