
To: Jeffrey EpsteinUeevacation@gmail.comj 
From: Cecile de Jongh 
Sent Tue 10/26/2010 5:56:08 PM 
Subject Re: Summary of Cost Associated with the Origins Symposium 

Easter is in April next year. 

Warm regards, 
Cecile 
Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 26, 2010, at 1:37 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

when is easter. ? i will come in and discuss 

On Tue, Oct 26, 2010 at 1:33 PM, Cecile de Jongh •r • wrote: 

I sent you the cost to move forward. The only question is whether the hotel will 
allow us to move to March and give is the credit for the payment for Nov. Do 
you have a date in mind? 

Warm regards, 
Cecile 
Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 26, 2010, at 1:05 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail,com> wrote: 

I am less concerned about their hesitancy to make plans with havinga 
conferenve that is not very good.. what is the cost to move forward„ 

On The, Oct 26, 2010 at 12:46 PM, Cecile de Jongh 
wrote: 

I have attached the analysis of what we think it will cost you 
to cancel ($60,995) or reschedule ($28,284) the Origins 
meeting. Judi Nagelberg is going to try to use her powers of 
persuasion to see if the Ritz will agree to give us a credit for 
use in March. It may require that we pay everything we owe 
($24,574) under the cancellation policy now and then move it 
forward to March with a credit. She is checking with them 
now. 

Please also consider future meeting such as this. I am sure 
that, if we cancel or reschedule, Krauss will let everyone 
know that you requested this and we do not want these 
people thinking that it is impossible to make plans with you. 
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DISCLAIMER: The Information contained in this e-mail may be 
privileged,confidential, and protected from disclosure. If you 
are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any 
dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication 
is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication 
in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all 
copies. 

************************** ********************************* 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
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including all attachments. 
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