
To: Jeffrey Epsteinfleevacationagmail.comj 
From: Cecile de Jongh 
Sent Mon 10/25/2010 8:12:05 PM 
Subject: Re: Re: 

Let me see. 

Warm regards, 
Cecile 
Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 25, 2010, at 3:01 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

are they refundable. will the hotel credit against our next conference? 
Infortunately business takes precedence 

On Mon, Oct 25, 2010 at 2:58 PM, Cecile de Jongh wrote: 

We will lose a lot of money. The airline tickets are all purchased and then we 
have the hotel. 

Warm regards, 
Cecile 
Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 25, 2010, at 2:06 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationRgmail,com> wrote: 

I now have to go no the middle east for the next two weeks. can we 
cancel the conference in nov 12 and recehdule for march. 

***************•********************************* 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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