
To: v i n • vacation@gmallcomj 
From: 
Sent Thur 11/4/2010 6:22:21 PM 
Subject Re: Lamps from Leah 

ok 

On Thu, Nov 4, 2010 at 6:03 PM, Jeevacation <jcevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

Walk over if you need to 

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 4, 2010, at 10:02 PM, wrote: 

> We are still trying to get payment details from Leah, I spoke to them this morning and they 
said they would send me invoice and payment instructions but have since been trying to get 
through to them on the cell and land line number numerous times with no luck. I am keeping 
Rich updated. I will keep trying. 
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