
To: Jeffrey Epsteinljeevacation©gmail.comj 
From: LSJ 
Sent Fri 5/28/2010 3:53:15 PM 
Subject: Re: Pierre Jules 

OK thank you 
Will inform Jules 
Warmest regards 

On May 28, 2010, at 11:01 AM, Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

pay 2500 of her expenses , my treat 

On Fri, May 28, 2010 at 10:53 AM, wrote: 

Good Morning 

Pierre Jules asked if I would contact you in reference to a personal loan -
$1,500.00. His mother passed away yesterday, she had been in hospital for the 
last week, hence a number of hospital bills are looming. He is unable to travel 
back for the funeral, but his brother will be leaving today, a flight that Jules has 
paid for. 
I know that the policy has been no personal loans, which I did explain to Jules, 
but he asked if I would still forward this request and would have the payments 
taken directly out of his wage at up to $500.00 per fortnight. 

For you consideration 

t 

regards 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 

EFTA_R1_01481894 
EFTA02417166



return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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