
To: Jeffrey EpsteinBeevacation©gmail.com] 
From: Rich Kahn 
Sent: Thur 5/27/2010 2:55:04 PM 
Subject: FW: LSJ Telco Items 

Bill presented for payment 26,788.26 to CSC for LS) 

Is this ok to pay? 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

fax 646-350-0954 

From: William Murphy [mailto 
Sent: Thursday, May 27, 2010 10:53 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: FW: LSJ Telco Items 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeeyacation@gmaitcom] 
Sent: Wednesday, May 26, 2010 9:30 AM 
To: William Murphy 
Cc: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Re: LS) Telco Items 

ok for itmcs for Isj 

On Wed, May 26, 2010 at 9:06 AM, William Murphy wrote: 
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Good morning sir. 

I wanted to see if you had an opportunity to review the items remaining for LSJ and if there are 
any questions. You mentioned on Friday submitting this list to Emad. Please let me know if you 
want me to proceed with that. 

Also, as far as the FSF phone switch is concerned, I called BestComm Friday. In order to use the 
switch here, we would have to upgrade the number of telephone lines and pull another cable from 
10F to 10B before installing the switch. Additionally, we would definitely see an increase in our 
Monthly Recurring Cost for telephone service. I will confirm with Brice today if there are T I 
services to the ranch and the likelihood of implementing this switch there. 

Thanks, 

WM 

William Murphy 

Systems Administrator— HBRK Associates 

F:646-350-03I4 

****************** ******************** ******** ************* 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jcevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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