To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com)
From: Rich Kahn

Sent: Mon 10/11/2010 10:42:23 PM

Subject: RE:

Pinto still owes JE 40,000 Euro for decoration belts however he has sent us an invoice for 12,606

for work at 9 East 71" street.

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto: jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, October 11, 2010 5:54 AM

To: Rich Kahn

Subject:

how much credit do we still have with Pinto

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(i gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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