
To: Jeffre E tein 'eevacationegmailcom] 
From: 
Sent Fri 11/5/2010 7:43:22 PM 
Subject: Re: Re: Re: 

Sent from my iPhone 

On 5 Nov 2010, at 15:30, Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@smail.com> wrote: 

no. it is not 

On Fri, Nov 5, 2010 at 3:09 PM, > wrote: 

She now says when I give her the check she has to wait for it to clear and then I 
can collect the lamps. Is this normal? And ok? Sorry to have to ask 

Sent from my iPhone 

On 5 Nov 2010, at 14:03, Jeevacation <jeevaeation@gmail.com> wrote: 

> Ok 

> Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

> On Nov 5, 2010, at 9:16 PM, wrote: 

>; wants to add 1775 on to the price of the lamps, I said that 20 000 was the agreed 
price, she said that is sales tax and if we don't pay it she is not giving them to us. 
Please advise. 

>> 
>> Sent from my iPhone 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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