
To: Jeffrey EpsteinUeevacationagmail.comj 
From: Rich Kahn 
Sent Wed 9/29/2010 4:21:16 PM 
Subject: FW: Ryan Dionne 

Ryan emailed asking the status of his unpaid invoice in the amount of 53,000 

Please advise 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 646-350-0954 

cell 

From: Rich Kahn 
Sent: Monday, September 27, 2010 2:17 PM 
To: 'Jeffrey Epstein' 
Subject: re: Ryan Dionne 

I spoke with GM and Ryan regarding invoice and employment. 

Ryan told me he worked 4 days last week: Tuesday for GM and Thursday, Friday & Saturday for 
JEE at rate of 750 per day 

Should I have GM pay her portion $750 or NES pay entire bill of 3,000 

Please advise 

Regarding 3 month trial we agreed to do as a consultant at rate of 12,500 per month (150,000 / 
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12) til 12/31/2010 and then if everyone was in agreement we would add to payroll with insurance 
benefits. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 646-350-0954 

cell 
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