
To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation©gmail.com] 
From: George Reenstra 
Sent: Tue 9/7/2010 2:26:16 PM 
Subject: RE: NBAA 

ok 

George Reenstra 

Aircraft Services Group Inc 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, September 07, 2010 10:34 AM 
To: George Reenstra 
Cc: Ivjet 
Subject: Re: NBAA 

no, to the show 

On Tue, Sep 7, 2010 at 10:18 AM, George Reenstra ‹ > wrote: 

I need an answer on this, also I am going to advertize 750 in the NBAA issue of the Controller 

George Reenstra 

Aircraft Services Group Inc 
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From: George Reenstra 
Sent: Friday, September 03, 2010 5:09 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein; Darren Indyke; Lvjet 
Subject: NBAA 

Sikorsky is planning on bringing one of the AAG Ships to display in the booth at NBAA. Since the goal is 
to sell yours I may be able to convince them to use 750. It would need to be in Atlanta around the 15th 
and be ready to leave there around the 22"° of October. Certainly will get lot of exposure with buyers. 
If you are willing I need to offer it up ASAP before they get to firmly committed to the AAG machine. 
As for cost, AAG costs them nothing they own it, if you want to be paid I need to know the complete 
amount ASAP 

I think this is a great opportunity to find a buyer. 

Darren, did you get the revised broker agreement ? 

Let me know. 

George Reenstra 

Aircraft Services Group Inc 
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************* 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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