To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com)]
From: Rich Kahn

Sent: Thur 10/7/2010 8:33:01 PM

Subject: FW: Wire

MES Invoice 10.8.10.doc

Ryan wants to be paid every two weeks and has attached an invoice for 6,250

Is this ok to pay?

Rich Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

381 East 66th Street, Suite 18F

New York, NY 1865

From: Ryan Dionne [
Sent: Thursday, October 07, 2010 2:11 PM
To: Rich Kahn

Subject: RE: Wire

Attached is the invoice. Let me know if you need the banking info again.

RD.

= Subject: RE: Wire
> Date: Thu, 7 Oct 2010 13:39:07 -0400

> From: N

>

> Please send invoice
= Thanks

>

>

= Rich Kahn

> HBRK Associates Inc.
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> 301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F
= New York, NY

=

=

> —--0Original Message-——

> From: Ryan Dionne [mait TGN
= Sent: Thursday, October 07, 2010 1:39 PM

> To: Rich Kahn

> Subject: Wire

>

= Hi Rich,

=

= Since I am technically a contract employee, do you need me to send an

> invoice prior to tomorrow's wire transfer?
>

= Best,

>

= Ryan

= Sent from my iPad
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