
To: JEE[jeeyacation@gmail.com] 
From: Cecile de Jongh 
Sent: Wed 9/15/2010 6:33:30 PM 
Subject: Fw: condos 

 Forwarded Messa 
From: Cecile de Jong 
To: Lawrence Krauss 
Cc: Lawrence Krauss 
Sent: Wed, September 15, 2010 2:30:21 PM 
Subject: Re: condos 

Lawrence, 

; Jeffrey Epstein <littlestjeff@yahoo.com> 

I think we can reimburse you for the cost of the condos as it is about what we are 
paying on the hotel side for the rest of the participants. I have cc'd Jeffrey on this so 
that he is aware of this. Also, please let me know if the names you last sent me are 
confirmed or, better yet, please as Penelope to send the final list as I need to give it to 
the hotel. 

Regards, 

Cecile 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and 
protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified 
that any dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly 
prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender 
immediately and delete all copies. 

From: Lawrence Krauss 
To: Cecile de Jongh 
Cc: Lawrence Krauss
Sent: Wed, September 15, 2010 1:15:15 PM 
Subject: condos 

In order to get two condos at the Ritz I need to use my own membership and I just checked that I 
can get two for 11-15.. It will cost me effectively 220/night per condo.. which is a bargain.. I 
believe that one of the two can be paid for by credit card when I am there. There other I would 
have to arrange out of my membership.. Can you reimburse me directly for that one? I will wait 
until I hear from you before confirming, because once I do, I am committed.. 
Lawrence 
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Lawrence M. Krauss 
Foundation Professor 
Director, The ASU Origins Project 
Co-Director, Cosmology Initiative 
Assoc. Dir, Beyond Center 
ARIZONA STATE UNIVERSITY 
College of Liberal Arts and Sciences 
School of Earth and Space Exploration 
PO Box 871404 I Tempe AZ 85287-1404 

http://krauss.faculty.asu.edu/ 
Exec. Asst (Jessica): 
Origins Asst (Cynthia 
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