
To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation©gmaitcom] 
Cc: Emad Hanna 
From: Gary Kemey 
Sent: Tue 8/24/2010 2:06:29 PM 
Subject: FW: Rimco 

Jeffrey I took you'r ok on Rimco to mean we were to proceed with payment and installation ,Was that 
accurate? 
Gary 

From: Emad Hanna [mailtc l 
Sent: Tue 8/24/2010 9:25 AM 
To: Gary Kerney 
Subject: Rimco 

Gary, 

I c mailed the boss asking him if his c mail means that we can pay that invoice and he has not 
responded as of yet 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 
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