To: ffr infj ion@gmail.com)

Cc:

From:

Sent: Tue 8/17/2010 12:34:12 AM
Subject: Re:

We can furmish you with current biweekly payroll stubs for the team so as to establish the day
rate.

We will bill every two weeks once we have burnt through the 15k retamer

Plus out of pocket expenses.

I will put this together...

Wayne please get this done for us

Thanks

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation{@gmail. com=
Date: Mon, 16 Aug 2010 16:25:51 -0600

To: Mark ZefF-
Subject: Re:

with our ability to confirm all costs.
On Mon, Aug 16, 2010 at 4:25 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail. com™ wrote:
agreed

On Mon, Aug 16, 2010 at 4:19 PM, Mark Zeft <mzefiia@markzeff.com=> wrote:

Agreed. .. we will calculate this per week. . ..the hourly will be adjusted to adhere to this

formulae. . .cost plus 25% which covers health and taxes

From; Jeffrey Epstein [mailto;jeevacationr gmail.com
Sent: Monday, August 16, 2010 5:36 PM
To: Mark Zeff
Ce: Doug Schoettle: Emad Hanna: Rich Kahn
Subject: Re:

the hourly is the actual cost of the help,, no mark, up,, if thier salary is 1000 per week and we
use 20 hoursthat we pay 500% no more. this is until we are satisfied that this job will get
built. In essence mark 1s not going to come out of pocket to help us, but in return he will not
make any money until we are sure this works.

On Mon, Aug 16, 2010 at 3:31 PM, Mark zcrr_ wrote:
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Doug

Jeftrey just hired me today to work on the LS] kitchen, living rm ,pool are and decoration of
some guest cabanas.. . .this will be on an hourly for a two month time frame.

If all goes well this arrangement will be discussed and revised.
Doug.. .Matt 1s the project management head at MARKZEFF and will coordinate entire project,
Jorge 1s lead project Architect and will liaise with you on all design aspects. Stacie will be the

interior and decoration designer for this project. All design will be overseen by me.

Lest have a kick off meeting as soon as you can so as to get going. . please reach out to Matt to

establish a time for this. . || NENEGNGNzGEGcx: 213
Thanks

Mark Zefl

Pressdent

MARKZEFF

213 West 20th St, 4'W

Mew York, NY 10011

Please consider the environment before printimg this e-mail
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 15 the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in ¢rror, please notify us immediately by

...................................................

destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

EFTA_R1_01491667
EFTA02424162



including all attachments.
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