
To: Jeffrey Epsteinueevacationagmaii.comj 
From: Rich Kahn 
Sent Wed 5/19/2010 1:17:15 PM 
Subject RE: 

Confirming that I am paying 133,519.96 (march 58,250 and april 75,269.96) 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York. NY 10065 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, May 19, 2010 5:17 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: 

pay weinberg bills 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jccvacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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