
To: Jeffrey EpsteinDeevacationSgmailcom] 
From: 
Sent Mon 4/5/2010 1:09:01 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Decision List and info 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: April 5, 2010 7:16:26 AM EDT 
To: 
Subject: e: ecision List and info 

We still have credit due 
Need to choose dog 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 4, 2010, at 10:33 AM, wrote:

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationegmail.com>
Date: A ril 4 2010 11:12:09 AM EDT 
To: 
Subject: Re: Decision List and info 

what happend to our dog credit from the shepards. 

On Sat, Apr 3, 2010 at 1:51 PM, wrote: 
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Begin forwarded message: 

ate:. ri : 5 PM EDT 
To: 
Subtec : e: ecision is and info 

Sarah 
can you forward this to Jeffrey, it keeps bouncing back 
sorry for any inconvenience 
thx Brice 

On Fri, Apr 2, 2010 at 6:58 PM bike ordon 
> wrote: 

As requested: 

LSJ Items: 
1: As discussed, attached budget for herb/vegetable garden for your 

approval, LSJ Veg.xlsx File 
2: Nanna do you wish to revisit refurbishments options of engines etc 
3: Personal vehicles on LSJ are 1 x Polaris, Ix Rhino, no Atv's. Should 

we revisit looking into purchasing 
replacement bikes etc. 

4: Do you wish to proceed with present Telcom bids submitted by Bill 
Murphy 

Zorro Items: 

1: Dakota Well, settlement agreement is still tied up in water rights 
legal division, then to OSE for final 
approval 

Proceeding with new/updated well spec for drilling bids due end of 
next week, this will be for deep well, 
3500f1 and Dakota well spec. 

I have revised plan to bring well locations closer to existing 
infrastructure to cut down on cost. 

Will forward once driller bids are in hand, Mid May 2010. 

I a: Business Lease Application 
Next step is for State Land office to view and assess lands covered 

under application, will schedule for May 
2010 
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2:Vehicles: Personal fleet consists of 1 x hummer, I x 2000 suburban, 
59000 miles do you wish to add to this 
fleet? 

Ranch fleet. Original 95 Tahoe, 160,000 miles, approx value 
$1600.00, recommend selling 

3: Mac computers, do you wish for Bill to purchase Mac computers for 
the main house #3 and the ranch office #1 

Please note the computer in GM's office needs to be replaced. 

4. Should I look into purchasing new dogs for the ranch, at this time 
there is only Lucky. 

If so, do you have a breed you particularly like and how many. 

5: Attached arc photo's of the Ponderosa pines at the Main Entrance to 
the house, a total of 6 did not make it 
through the winter. 

If you wish to replace, would suggest Austrian Pines, more suited to 
this location. Ponderosa Pines 001-1 to 
003 

6: Attached are photo's of the ceramic urns, original number 16, to date 
there are 3 of various colors. 

do you wish to replace. ceramic pots MH 001-1 to 002-1 

7: FYI items 
Fountain install is scheduled for 1st week of May, weather 

permitting 

New bids for stucco repair will be forwarded end of April, Gary is 
aware of damage and will review before 
forwarding to you. 

The Terrace area's outside the master bedroom and 2nd floor living 
room/office require some refurbishment 

Gary is aware of the situation, estimates will be forwarded for you 
consideration 

See attached photo's, DSFC0002 to 0005 

Main House Water line developed a major leak, 15000 gallons a day, 
just inside the Z entrance, were the old 
guard house use to stand. Unfortunately 
the 

phone line was buried directly under the water line at this point and 
was damaged during digging. leak is 
repaired, phone to RC next week. 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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