
To: Rich Kah Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail con)] 
From: 
Sent Mon 3/22/2010 6:23:59 PM 
Subject Re: wiring instructions 

Hi 
I have received it on Friday and we are Monday. It will be done but i don't see the emergency for 
asking me twice in 3 days to pay an invoice. 

Sent via BlackBerry from T-Mobile 

From: "Rich Kahn" ca 
Date: Mon, 22 Mar 2010 14:08:29 -0400 
To: 
Subject: FW: wiring instructions 

Was this paid yet ? 

Please let me know 

Thanks 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

From: Tama Beth Kudman P.A. [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, March 22, 2010 1:13 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: RE: wiring instructions 
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Hi Rich. I'm just checking whether you got my wiring instructions. Also, I billed an additional 
three hours the day after I submitted my bill in research and drafting my response to the motion to 
compel. That is an additional $900. Could you please add that amount to the wire transfer? 

Thank you. 

Tama 

Tama Beth Madman, P.A. 

Philips Point 

777 South Flagler drive 

Suite 800 - West Tower 

West Palm Beach, Florida 33401 

From: Rich Kahn [mailtc 
Sent: Friday, March 12, 2010 11:49 AM 
To: 
Subject: re: wiring instructions 

Can you please email me wiring instructions so that I can pay your outstanding invoice for Jean 
Luc in the amount of 4560 

Thank you 
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Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 

New York, NY 10065 
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