
To: Jeffrey Epsteinfleevacation©gmail.com] 
From: George Reenstra 
Sent: Wed 3/31/2010 7:00:43 PM 
Subject: RE: 10% issue 

What does it take to finish this today, including getting a check...I need to give them a path to finish this 
and time is running out. 

George Reenstra 

Aircraft Services Group Inc 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, March 31, 2010 3:07 PM 
To: George Reenstra 
Subject: Re: 10% issue 

they cannot cancel, why would i do that 

On Wed, Mar 31, 2010 at 2:58 PM, George Reenstra wrote: 

If I get the 10% for the 30 days max or until either side cancels the deal will you proceed today, also I 
assume it will need to be a check due to the time so you even get more float...please advise ASAP as I 
need to try, no promises but I need your answer to try 

George Reenstra 

Aircraft Services Group Inc 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to keyacation@grnail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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