To: Jeffrey Epstein[ieevacation@gmail.com]; _

From: George Reenstra
Sent: Tue 3/30/2010 11:55:18 PM
Subject: FW: Epstein

This went to Sikorsky, | think it encompasses all we spoke about, if you have comments please advise.

George Reenstra

Aircraft Services Group Inc

From: George Reenstra

Sent: Tuesday, March 30, 2010 7:54 PM

To: 'Poland, Marc B SIK'; 'Bond, Carey SIK'; 'Powell, David SIK'; 'Germon, Howard H SIK'
Subject: Epstein

| believe here is where we are with JE at this point

He needs an email laying out all the terms first thing in the moming.

Both the C++ and the D total price 24 .4m, to retain this price a deposit of 10m must be received in a
manner acceptable to Sikorsky by COB 31 March 2010

The deposit shall be totally refundable if terms and conditions are not reached by COB April 30 2010.
Interest on the deposit shall be earned if refunded at a rate of ( Marc, | think | heard 10% but | was not
party to that conversation).
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| think there needs ta be a spec meeting ASAP with all the players so we can resolve the differences and
confusion in the spec. Larry changed the spec and | am not sure where that fits. His changes look like
standard vip with minor mods. All of this is resolvable at the spec meeting.

Jeffery wants to understand issues regarding pricing and quite frankly | can't answer his gquestions.
Perhaps we invite him to the meeting.

Once we have some time | want to explore using the D as a demo bird |

| do believe we can get the deposit and stop the clock to resolve any differences

George Reenstra

Aircraft Services Group Inc
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