
To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation©gmail.com] 
From: George Reenstra 
Sent: Tue 3/30/2010 7:45:19 PM 
Subject: RE: Sikorsky 

Working it, going to see if they will lease back the d as a demonstrator from you to close the gap 

George Reenstra 

Aircraft Services Group Inc 

300 Corporate Drive, Suite 2 

Mahwah, NJ 07430 

Tel 

Fax 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeeyacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, March 30, 2010 3:21 PM 
To: George Reenstra 
Cc: lyjet 
Subject: Re: Sikorsky 

I can do it with a d price as well „ i don't understand why mart is unwilling to detail larrys d 

On Tue, Mar 30, 2010 at 2:07 PM, George Reenstra wrote: 

Larry and I spoke this morning, he mentioned he was going to your house but apparently didn't see you. 
I am sure from reading the emails you can see my doubts about this buyer from the other broker. 
Regarding the deal Sikorsky offered to you. I personally think it could be fine tuned and either meet or 
be close to your goal. Also naturally 750 is not sold but there is activity. The Sikorsky offer is incredible 
and fully refundable if you can not come to terms in April. Naturally I am wearing my sales hat but I think 
with a little time this could turn a nice profit for you and all could occur while your deposit remains 
refundable. Sikorsky deal needs time to fix, everything is moving fast. I urge you to give them the 
deposit, you will not regret it , in my opinion 

Please advise. 
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George Reenstra 

Aircraft Services Group Inc 

300 Corporate Drive, Suite 2 

Mahwah, NJ 07430 

Tel 

Fax 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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