
To: Jeffrey EpsteinueeyacationGigmailcomj 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Tue 3/9/2010 9:49:28 PM 
Subject: RE: Leon Black 

thx 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, March 09, 2010 4:49 PM 
To: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Re: Leon Black 

yes 

On Tue, Mar 9, 2010 at 4:26 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

We rec'd an Annual Invoice for Statutory Representation from CT Corp for the Leon Black 
Family Foundation...Invoice is for $358.00. 

Do you want me to forward to Leon's office? 
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The information contained in this communication is 
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