
To: " cation@gmail.com] 
From: 
Sent: Tue 3/2/2010 5:08:12 PM 
Subject: Fw: 750 

Sounds like Chris is in trouble, see email below from Reenstra, 

Sent from my BlackBerry® wireless handheld 

From: "George Reenstra" 
Date: Tue, 2 Mar 2010 11:44:56 -0500 
To: 
Subject: 750 

Still waiting to hear on the buyer but in case he folds I need to get this closed. I think I can convince 
Sikorsky to give JE another 20K to close this week, and you can leave it at Keystone until you are 
ready Please ask him as a favor to me, it is causing a world of hurt for Chris and I am trying to fix 
the problem and have gone out on a limb telling them to give what JE was promised and I think it would 
close. Need an answer MAP...trust me it will earn a great deal of gratitude which I know I can work to 
your advantage at AAG in the future. 

George Reenstra 

Aircraft Services Group Inc 

300 Corporate Drive, Suite 2 

Mahwah, NJ 07430 
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