
To: Jeffrey Epsteinfleeyacation©gmail.com] 
From: Emad Hanna 
Sent: Wed 2/24/2010 8:59:48 PM 
Subject: RE: Randy's invoice 

Jeffrey, 

Randy said he would like to keep the nursery relationship with you going forward so will take off 25% on 
the total invoice. 

Would this be acceptable? 

Thanks 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, February 24, 2010 12:38 PM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Re: Randy's invoice 
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unacceptable 

On Wed, Feb 24, 2010 at 3:35 PM, Emad Hanna 

Jeffrey, 

Randy offered to take out 10% off from the $ 21,755.83 

What will you be willing to accept? 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

3i34 , 4.4.*******4.*****4.*****4.***4.***4.***4.*84.4kEtakEtakicatic********** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com and 

wrote: 
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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