
To: Jeffrey Epsteinfieeyacation©gmail.com] 
From: Rich Kahn 
Sent: Fri 2/19/2010 2:20:58 PM 
Subject: RE: JE bill - Feb. 18, 2010 

Please confirm I am paying total balance due of $33,637.50. 

In addition is this correct: 

Feb. 11 4 hours : Meeting with Josephsberg and Podhurst 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cell 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2010 9:32 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: JE bill - Feb. 18, 2010 

pay 

 Forwarded message 
From: Carolyn Cohen 
Date: Thu, Feb 18, 2010 at 6:08 PM 
Subject: JE bill - Feb. IS, 2010 
To: Rich Kahn M.M.M.L IM jecvacationikgmail.com 
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February 18, 2010 

Dear Jeffrey, 

I have still not received payment for my bill of January 25, 2010, even after providing detailed 
hours on January 30th. 

Since that time, I have devoted the following hours: 

Jan. 26 
meeting 

Jan. 27 

.25 hour: Conversation with Marty Weinberg, discussion regarding Sloman 

.25 hour: Scheduling Sloman meeting, discussions 

Jan. 28 .25 hour: 
conversation with 

Feb. 1 .50 hour: 

Feb. 2 .50 hour: 
Sloman 

Conversation with Jeffrey Epstein regarding Josephsberg, 

Marty Weinberg 

Conversation with Jeffrey Epstein, review email 

Conversations with Marty Weinberg, review of email, prep for 

Meeting 

Feb. 3 5.25 hours: Meeting with Black and Sloman, preparation, review of email 

Feb. 4 & 5 .25 hour: Calls with Marty Weinberg, review of emails 

Feb. 8 .25 hour: Discussion with Jeffrey Epstein, letter 

Feb. 9 .25 hour: Review of emails, conversation with Marty Weinberg 

Feb. 10 .50 hour: Conversation with Jeffrey Epstein, review of Josephsberg material 

Feb. 11 4 hours : Meeting with Josephsberg and Podhurst 

Feb. 12 .25 hour: Discussion with Marty Weinberg 

Feb. 15 —17 .25 hour: Call with Marty Weinberg, review of email to Villafonte 

TOTAL: 12.75 HOURS @$1150/HOUR $14,662.50 

The total I am now owed on my past two bills comes to $33,637.50. I would really appreciate 
having the funds wired as soon as possible. 
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Cordially, 

Alan 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to kevacationfitgmall com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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