
To: Jeevacation[jeevacation@gmail.com] 
From: Rich Kahn 
Sent: Wed 1/27/2010 8:20:10 PM 
Subject: January invoice for Gary & Steve 
Epstein invoice, 01-20-10.pdf 

Please advise if ok to pay January services for Gary & Steve totaling 43,365.20 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 

New York, NY 10065 

From: Sharon Myers [mailto:SMyers@landmarklandco.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, January 20, 2010 11:39 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: January invoice 

Attached is the January invoice. Let me know if you have any questions. 

Sharon C. Myers 

Landmark Land Company. Inc. 

Phone (301)715-2021 

Far (301) 574-5383 
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