
To: Jeffrey EpsteinBeeyacation©gmail.com] 
From: Cecile de Jongh 
Sent: Thur 1/21/2010 6:47:19 PM 
Subject: Re: VIPA Application 

The term is five (5) years and Kenn Hobson says he "thinks" it's $15/ sq ft. Kenn has 
also said that Hank form the Jet Center submitted an application at the very beginning 
of this month "supposedly" in conjunction with James Derr. 

The VIPA has not been able to locate or contact Derr or White and Kenn said he will 
not accept Hank's application since he cannot get in touch with Derr. I need to submit 
this application ASAP, if you approve it. I also need a check for $150 for the app fee -
TWA, LLC does not have a bank account. What entity would you like to pay this out 

of? 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and 
protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified 
that any dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly 
prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender 
immediately and delete all copies. 

From: Jeffrey Epstei <• v i na m il. m> 
To: Cecile de Jongh 

• •Sent: Thu, January , . . 
Subject: Re: VIPA Application 

do we know the term and dollar amounts? 

On Thu, Jan 21, 2010 at 1:19 PM, Cecile de Jongh <ceciledejonghayahoo.com> wrote: 

JE, 

Sorry this took so long, our phones and intcrnct at the office (and the entire cast end) have been 
out all week. kVe arc now using a wireless card until Innovative can fix the problem. 

Cecile 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and 
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protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that 
any dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If 
you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete 
all copies. 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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