
To: Jeffre E teirf eevacation©gmail.comj 
From: 
Sent Sun 1/24/2010 5:28:35 PM 
Subject Re: Re: 

is 1700$ but i hope I'll share with another girl... 
On Jan 24, 2010, at 11:42 AM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

great.. how much money for advance 

On Sun, Jan 24, 2010 at 11:32 AM, wrote: 

I met few girls at castings but nothing special, and I have 2 new roomates from 
Brazil but they are not friendly at all. Very strange coz all the brazilian girls I met 
before they were really cool! 

Regarding the apartment, well I found something but I can't afford it,and the agency won't 
advance me money since they are offering me a place to stay. 

Workwise nothing new so far. This week were just 2 castings... Ron said that it will start 
to be more soon...let's see. 

And u? 
Kisses 

Sent via BlackBerry from T-Mobile 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Sun, 24 Jan 2010 09:49:12 -0500 
To: 
Subject: 

well? 
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