
To: Jeffrey EpsteinUeevacation@gmail.com] 
From: story cowles 
Sent Mon 12/14/2009 5:03:39 PM 
Subject Fw: "Invoice" 

Email from joc Doran (Stopeks lighting guy) 
Do I respond to this? 

--- On Mon, 12/14/09, Joe Doran 

From: Joe Doran 
Subject: "invoice" 
To: "story cowles" 
Date: Monday, December 14, 2009, 11:47 AM 

MC: 

Hi Story, 
Could you please check on an invoice we sent on 10/16/09 #2475 in the amount of $2696.17. It's 
coming on 60 days past due. If there is some issue with it, can you please let me know as we would 
like to clear it by the end of the month for year end. 

Thanks, 
Joe 
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