To: ffr infj i gmail.com)]
From:

Sent; Wed 12/16/2009 11:17:17 PM

Subject: Re:

Thanks . So I should call her? Is she in the office tomorrow 7

Sent via BlackBerry from T-Mobile

From: Jeflrey Epstem <jeevacationf@gmail com=>

Date: Wed. 16 Dec 2009 16:47:54 -0500

To: |
Subject: Re:

yes,, don't worry

wWrote:

Hi Jeffery ,| have been getting a letter from the MCS claim services and it says |
didnt pay them a Bill from Mount Sinai Anesthesia when | got my X Ray when | broke
my pinky. | think it was cause they didn't do billing, | would have had to pay it up front,
but Leslie talked to the person on the phone for me and | dont know what happened.

should | call Leslie ?
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeftrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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