
To: Jeffrey Epsteinueevacationagmail.comj 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Tue 11/24/2009 8:10:45 PM 
Subject: RE: FW: From Kira 

I will pay Spring : 

Summary Account Balance: $1,277.50 

Thanks! 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, November 24, 2009 3:07 PM 
To: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Re: FW: From Kira 

pay spring 

On Tue, Nov 24, 2009 at 2:52 PM, Lesley Groff •c=a ,  wrote: 

HI Jeffrey...just wondering what you would like me to do!? 

From: Kira Titeneva [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, November 23, 2009 5:02 PM 
To: Lesley Groff 
Subject: From Kim 

Hi, Leslie! 
I hope everything is well with you and you are getting ready to have a blast during the holidays. 

I am finishing my semester at FIT in December. I registered for Winter class and two Spring 
classes. 
I am attaching the invoice. Please let me know if you have any questions or concerns. 

Sincerely, Kira 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to ice\ acation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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