
To: Jeffrey Epsteinfleevacation©gmail.com] 
From: Emad Hanna 
Sent: Tue 9/8/2009 5:49:03 PM 
Subject: RE: Stopek 2009 payments 

Jeffrey, 

Since 01.01-07 to today Stopek has been paid $ 232,853 broken down as follows: 

Plant and Material purchase $ 145,102 

Maintenance $ 36,900 

Installation fees $ 29,995 

Irrigation $ 20,856 

Sincerely 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 
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From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, September 08, 2009 12:37 PM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Re: Stopek 2009 payments 

past three years 

On Tue, Sep 8, 2009 at 12:36 PM, Emad Hanna Ma> wrote: 

No problem, 

Do you want it for this year or would you like me to go further back? 

From: Jeffrey Epstein frnailto:teevaeation(iPemailicoml 
Sent: Tuesday, September 08, 2009 12:29 PM 

To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Re: Stopek 2009 payments 

please give me a total of all expndtures thanks„ 

On The, Sep 8, 2009 at 12:22 PM, Emad Hanna wrote: 

Jeffrey, 

Yes we purchased the palms through him. 

I attached a copy of the two major purchases through him one in 2009 and the other in 2008 

Emad Hanna 
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Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailtoiemeationftmail.coml 
Sent: Tuesday. September 08. 2009 12:05 PM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Re: Stopek 2009 payments 

did we not buy all the palms in the renovation through him 

On Tue, Sep 8, 2009 at 12:01 PM, Emad Hanna wrote: . › 

Jeffrey, 

Attached is all the payouts to Stopek this year and detail of the expenditures. 

The royal palm pruning was done only once this year on 6/8/09. 

Randy will be available to you to answer any question that you may have while he is on the 
property tomorrow morning. 
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Please let me know if you need any additional information 

Sincerely 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

Ncw York, NY 10150 

*************************************** ******************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return c-mail or by c-mail to jesvacationegmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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************* 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return c-mail or by c-mail to jecvacationggmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 

EFTA_R1_01508994 

EFTA02436477


