To: Jeffrey Epstein[ieevacation@gmail.com)]

From: Emad Hanna
Sent: Tue 9/8/2009 2:25:23 PM
Subject: RE:

He was supposed to do that. | gather that didn’t happen since your mentioning that?
I will look at his invoices and see if he charged us for that and then give him a call.

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, September 08, 2009 10:16 AM

To: Emad Hanna

Subject: Re:

thanks,, also i thought he was supposed to trim the trees for the money he is getting

On Tue, Sep 8, 2009 at 10:11 AM, Emad Hanna _wmtc:

| will put those figures together and send them over and Randy will be at the house tomorrow morning
10:00 am to look at the bougainvilleas

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jecvacation( gmail.com)|
Sent: Tuesday, September 08, 2009 9:12 AM

To: Emad Hanna

Subject:

please give me figure of how much we have paid stopek for all the landscape at the house.. 1
would like randy or someone else to opine on the bogenvilllas |, are they just crappy the flowers
are muted and small.
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Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thercof is strictly prohibited
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by

destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epsten

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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